Schuld, Derek

From: Schuld, Derek

Sent: Tuesday, February 25, 2020 8:49 AM

To: Document Services; Witzel-Behl, Maribeth
Cc: Assessor; Staffaroni, Jaime

Subject: RE: Missing Tax Claim

On my way.

Derek B. Schuld, SBWCP

Legal Administrative Assistant
Office of the City Attorney

City-County Building, Room 401

210 Martin Luther King, Jr. Blvd.
Madison, Wisconsin 53703

Tel: 608-266-4511 | Fax: 608-267-8715
https://www.cityofmadison.com

PRIVILEGE AND CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This electronic message is intended only for the designated recipient(s). It may contain privileged or confidential information and should
not be disclosed to third parties without our express permission. If you are not the intended recipient, you have received this message in
error; review, dissemination, or copying of this message is prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately, delete the original message, and destroy any electronic or printed copies of this message. Thank you.

From: Document Services <DocumentServices@cityofmadison.com>

Sent: Tuesday, February 25, 2020 8:48 AM

To: Schuld, Derek <DSchuld@cityofmadison.com>; Witzel-Behl, Maribeth <MWitzel-Behl@cityofmadison.com>
Cc: Assessor <assessor@cityofmadison.com>; Staffaroni, Jaime <JStaffaroni@cityofmadison.com>

Subject: RE: Missing Tax Claim

Hi Derek —

Please bring the claim to Document Services for processing. After a search in Legistar, we also did not see that it had
been entered. Thanks.

From: Schuld, Derek <DSchuld@cityofmadison.com>

Sent: Monday, February 24, 2020 12:29 PM

To: Witzel-Behl, Maribeth <MWitzel-Behl@cityofmadison.com>

Cc: Document Services <DocumentServices@cityofmadison.com>; Assessor <assessor@cityofmadison.com>; Staffaroni,
Jaime <JStaffaroni@cityofmadison.com>

Subject: Missing Tax Claim

Importance: High

Maribeth,

| am currently working on Jaime’s reports for the claims of excessive tax assessments to submit for the March 3™
meeting, and | am having difficulty matching one with its Legistar file. This is a claim made by Wal-Mart Real Estate
Business Trust for tax parcel number 081033404071 at 4198 Nakoosa Trail. The claim is stamped as having been
received on January 27™, but unlike the others | have there is no City master form with it. The searches I've done pull up
last year’s claim only. Could you please check to see if this claim was entered or not? Thank you.
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Derek B. Schuld, SBWCP

Legal Administrative Assistant
Office of the City Attorney

City-County Building, Room 401

210 Martin Luther King, Jr. Blvd.
Madison, Wisconsin 53703

Tel: 608-266-4511 | Fax: 608-267-8715
https://www.cityofmadison.com

PRIVILEGE AND CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This electronic message is intended only for the designated recipient(s). It may contain privileged or confidential information and should
not be disclosed to third parties without our express permission. If you are not the intended recipient, you have received this message in
error; review, dissemination, or copying of this message is prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately, delete the original message, and destroy any electronic or printed copies of this message. Thank you.
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Schuld, Derek

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Follow Up Flag:
Flag Status:

Document Services

Wednesday, February 26, 2020 8:13 AM
Schuld, Derek

Tax claim has been entered

Follow up
Completed

You can pick up hard copies of claim at Document Services.

Thanks.
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