
Website
elliebraunart.myportfolio.com

Mosaic Experience

Mosaic work has become an 
integral part of my practice as an 
artist,  as I continue to expand and 
explore more 3D work. I draw a lo…

Community Engagement Process

Community is a large part of my 
practice and I work to engage the 
community in my work in most 
things I do. Having worked with t…

Artistic Vision

When I create mosaics, I enjoy 
using a wide range of materials to 
create interest and texture. In 
addition to traditional glass and …

Other Notes / Special Requirements:

-one of the pieces in my work 
samples is a layout of the design 
for the layout. The colors are a bit 
more neon than I will make have …

Website

Mosaic Experience

-I first learned the principles of 
mosaic art at the Verona Road 
redevelopment community mosaic 
project designed and facilitated b…

Community Engagement Process

-Co-creation is the essence of my 
community engagement process, 
and in this sense,  every project is 
different, but every project begins…

Artistic Vision

-My approach to mosaics depends 
on the goals. When making 
signage, I approach it with careful 
planning and pre-production; wh…

Other Notes / Special Requirements:

As my love of mosaics has grown, I 
have sought technical and creative 
training wherever it was available, 
exploring many different styles an…

Website
www.truemosaics.com

Mosaic Experience

I am a professional mosaic artist 
with over 30 years of experience 
specializing in public art, 
architectural mosaics, and creativ…

Community Engagement Process

Community engagement has 
always been an important facet of 
my work. I have incorporated social 
practice into my work in various …

Artistic Vision

I’ve approached mosaic creation in 
multiple ways including direct 
setting onto a substrate, creation 
on cement boards, and using off-…

Other Notes / Special Requirements:

I'm from the Midwest, went to 
school at UW-Madison, did some 
of my early architectural mosaics in 
Madison ,and am excited to …
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