

2012 Street & Sewer Reconstruction

Group B, C & D
July 15, 2011

Bidding Consultant	B-1
Royal Oak Engineering	\$2,600.00
RH Batterman	\$3,100.00
Burse Surveying & Engineering	NO BID
General Engineering Company	\$2,435.00
JSD Professional Services	\$3,500.00
D'Onofrio Kottke & Associates	\$2,700.00
MSA Professional Services	\$4,500.00
American Surveying & Engineering (ASE)	\$9,237.09

Bidding Consultant	C-1	C-2	C-3	C-4	C-5	C-6	C-7	C-8	C-9	C-10	C-11	C-12	C-13	C-14	Total (C1-C14)
Royal Oak Engineering	\$700.00	\$4,700.00	\$2,200.00	\$1,600.00	\$2,700.00	\$2,400.00	\$3,300.00	\$900.00	\$850.00	\$3,300.00	\$1,100.00	\$700.00	\$2,400.00	\$800.00	\$27,650.00
RH Batterman	\$1,162.50	\$7,285.00	\$3,875.00	\$2,170.00	\$4,495.00	\$4,572.00	\$5,580.00	\$1,162.00	\$1,705.00	\$4,340.00	\$2,015.00	\$1,364.00	\$5,115.00	\$1,433.75	\$46,274.25
Burse Surveying & Engineering	\$650.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$655.00	\$800.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2,200.00	\$920.00	\$6,725.00
General Engineering Company	\$7,175.00	\$3,345.00	\$2,375.00		\$3,175.00	\$3,385.00	\$3,725.00			\$3,180.00			\$2,850.00		\$29,210.00
JSD Professional Services	\$1,200.00	\$3,000.00	\$2,700.00	\$2,100.00	\$3,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$1,200.00	\$850.00	\$3,100.00	\$1,250.00	\$850.00	\$2,600.00	\$1,700.00	\$29,550.00
D'Onofrio Kottke & Associates	\$1,000.00	\$4,600.00	\$2,700.00	\$2,100.00	\$2,900.00	\$3,200.00	\$3,800.00	\$1,100.00	\$1,300.00	\$3,500.00	\$1,600.00	\$1,200.00	\$3,000.00	\$1,300.00	\$33,300.00
MSA Professional Services	\$850.00	\$5,400.00	\$2,300.00	\$1,650.00	\$2,350.00	\$2,350.00	\$3,550.00	\$950.00	\$1,000.00	\$3,250.00	\$1,150.00	\$850.00	\$2,450.00	\$1,050.00	\$29,150.00
American Surveying & Engineering (ASE)	\$5,966.27	\$24,265.73	\$12,154.14	\$7,796.62	\$13,378.04	\$13,924.17	\$18,287.24	\$5,250.10	\$5,953.91	\$15,928.67	\$7,163.55	\$5,183.08	\$13,924.17	\$5,456.14	\$154,651.83

Bidding Consultant	D-1
Royal Oak Engineering	\$10,200.00
RH Batterman	\$12,206.25
Burse Surveying & Engineering	\$8,200.00
General Engineering Company	\$9,848.00
JSD Professional Services	\$9,500.00
D'Onofrio Kottke & Associates	\$14,900.00
MSA Professional Services	\$19,600.00
American Surveying & Engineering (ASE)	\$41,618.08

All Group Total

\$40,450.00
 \$61,580.50
 \$41,493.00
 \$42,550.00
 \$50,900.00
 \$53,250.00
 \$205,506.98